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H&H Group announced that last year, the company reported 
revenue of $13.93 billion, an increase of 9.0%.  Among them, 
revenue from the Chinese market reached 9.97 billion RMB, up 4% 
year-on-year. Nutritional supplements have become the main 
engine of growth for the group, the company said, with nutritional 
supplements among the three main businesses having achieved 
rapid growth of 30%, accounting for 60.4% of the company's total 
revenue, and Akash Bedi, CEO of H&H, said they will continue to 
deepen its whole-family nutrition and health layout.
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Fucoxanthin sulphate, the current market price is stable at 13.6-
13.7usd, the price gap between factories is not big, and the price 
acceptance of customers is also better; the factory price has 
remained firm recently, and it is expected to run steadily in the later 
period

API
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Arginine: the recent rise in soybean meal prices, pulling arginine 
market demand, superimposed on the previous arginine prices 
have been at the bottom of the factory offer a slight upward 
fluctuation, the trade market price of 4.9usd/kg or so, there are 
factories reported to 5.1usd/kg, follow up to pay attention to the 
market turnover situation.

AMINO ACID
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Recently, the vitamin market as a whole remained stable, the 
terminal just need to buy, individual categories of prices strong. 26 
March, B1, B6 manufacturers raised prices one after another, 
before the B1, B6 has been a number of rounds of price increases, 
each time the rate of increase is limited. For factories, the market 
turnover steadily improved, the situation is good, and customers 
will not worry about excessive fluctuations caused by panic 
purchases.
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